
 
                        Hold Harmless Release and Covenant Not To Sue 
 
                 * Must be completed and returned with registration form 
 
I, ___________________________, the undersigned, have requested the privilege to participate in the 
Scent Theory workshop presented by Giant Schnauzer Club of America and Terry McGauley. (Hereinafter 
called the “workshop”). To be held at the Henry Frazier Camp Reservation building in Shepherdsville, Ky. 
March 9, 2007 through March 11, 2007, such application been made by my own, for consideration of 
participating in the workshop.  
 
I understand and acknowledge that I am aware that there are inherent dangers and risks in training with 
k9's, and I understand that if I participate in the workshop that I accept the inherent dangers and risks to me, 
and my dog(s), and my equipment. 
 
Therefore, in consideration for allowing me to participate in such training and other activities at the 
workshop, I hereby agree not to sue the officers, agents, members, instructors, and their staff and hereby 
waive and release the staff or other organizations assisting with the workshop, to wit: Giant Schnauzer Club 
of America, or any other group or assistants helping with the workshop, and their successors and assigns, 
from all claims, demands, rights, or causes of action, known or unknown, accruing in my favor as a result 
of personal injury or loss or damage of property (including that of my dog(s) or any claim arising from or 
caused during such training or activity in connection with the workshop taking place March 9, 2007 
through March 11, 2007. The applicant a lso acknowledges, accepts, executes, and agrees to bind to this 
HOLD Harmless Release and Covenant Not to Sue all who may hereafter make claim through or for the 
undersigned applicant. Including, but not limited to, the executors, administrators, successors, and assigns 
of the undersigned applicant, including, but not limited to, the executors, administrators, successors, and 
assigns of the undersigned applicant. The undersigned applicant also acknowledges that this Hold Harmless 
Release and Covenant Not to  Sue may not be chanted or amended orally or written in any way.  
 
Signed this _____________day of _____________________, 2007. 
 
Signature of applicant:_______________________________  
 
PROPERTY DAMAGE AGREEMENT  
 
I,_______________________________, the undersigned, understand and agree that I am responsible for 
any and all damages caused by my dog(s), including but not limited to property damage and or injuries to 
other dog(s) during activities associated with the workshop presented by Giant Schnauzer Club of America 
(hereafter called the workshop), to be held in Shepherdsville Ky. March 9, 2007 through March 11, 2007.  
 
Signed this:________________day of___________________, 2007  
 
Signature of applicant:____________________________________  
 


